AGENDA
Freedom Township Board of Supervisors
January 5, 2026, Immediately Following Reorganizational Meeting
1. Call to Order
2. Public Comment

3. Approval of Minutes — December 17, 2025 — Regular Meeting

4. Monthly Expenses - Approval of the bills for the month of December: General Fund -
$16,860.42 & Fire Tax Fund - $4,290.13.

5. Manager & Road Reports
6. EMS, Fire, & Police Reports
7. Old Business

A. Consider awarding 2026 stone contract(s).

Item New Enterprise Stone & Lime Specialty Granules
- FOB / Ton Delivered / Ton FOB / Ton Delivered / Ton

2A Aggregate $12.00 $16.05 $6.50 $12.75
2RC Aggregate $7.40 $12.14 $6.50 $12.75
#3 Stone $16.00 $21.44 $12.25 $18.50
#4 Stone $17.50 $21.44 No Bid No Bid
#8 Stone $20.00 $24.05 $16.50 $22.75
#57 Stone $16.00 $20.05 $13.25 $19.50
#67 Stone $16.00 $20.05 No Bid No Bid
Cold Mix $155.00 $159.05 No Bid No Bid
Screenings $11.00 $15.05 $10.00 $16.25
Gabion Stone $19.00 $24.05 $14.00 $20.25
AS3 Anti-Skid $18.00 $22.85 No Bid No Bid

8. New Business
A. Consider approval of Resolution 2026-03, disposition of public records for 2015.

B. Approval of Resolution 2026-04 & Promulgation for consideration.
e The Township must reapprove the Emergency Operations Plan of Adams County
every two years to be compliant with the PA Emergency Management Service’s
Code.




C. Consider approval of the following volunteers that met the minimum criteria set forth in
the Volunteer Service Tax Credit Ordinance & Resolution for 2025.
a. Edward Buchheit, Jr., Paul Buchheit, Mary Buchheit, Neil Price, Keith Schultz,
James Geleta, John Sica, Timothy Williams, & Francis Williams.

D. Consider approval of a stormwater & maintenance agreement for 374 Cunningham
Road.

E. Consider rejecting all trash/recycle contractor bids and rebid.
9. Other Business
10. Public Comment

11. Adjournment



